
Those unvaccinated against
Covid-19 who have contracted the
virus and recovered aremore likely
to face heart complications a year
later, according to the findings of a
nationwide study.
People in this grouphave a 56per

cent higher risk of heart complica-
tions, such as heart failure, stroke
and blood clots, a year after falling
sick with Covid-19 compared with
uninfected individuals.
Based on tests andmedical claim

records of 106,012 residents in Sin-
gapore diagnosed with Covid-19,
the study found that 912 recovered
patients had lingering after-effects
such as fatigue, shortness of

breath, problems with memory
and heart complications.
The study found that 311 unvacci-

nated people who did not suffer
from abnormal heartbeat prior to
Covid-19 infection developed the
condition a year after the infection.
This Covid-19-positive group of

over 100,000 residents was com-
pared with nearly 1.7 million in the
community who were not known
to be infectedwith the virus during
that time, and the two groups were
tracked over an average period of
300 days, looking at whether they
developed long Covid syndrome
and heart complications, in partic-
ular.

The study was carried out by
Nanyang Technological Universi-
ty’s (NTU) Lee Kong Chian School
of Medicine (LKCMedicine), the
Ministry of Health, Singapore Gen-
eral Hospital and National Centre
for Infectious Diseases between
September and November in 2021,
when the Delta variant was predo-
minant.
It is the first and largest study to

examine the risk of long Covid in a
highly vaccinated, multi-ethnic
South-east Asian population.
The study was published in Sep-

tember in Clinical Infectious Dis-
eases, one of themost heavily cited
journals in the fields of infectious

-

Singapore is currently going
through a Covid-19 infection wave,
with estimated daily cases rising
from about 1,000 three weeks ago
to 2,000 in the past two weeks.
Last Friday, Health Minister Ong

Ye Kung said protection against se-
vere forms of Covid-19, whether
through vaccination or illness as a
result of the virus, wanes around
the 12-month mark, and that those
most at risk must take their annual
vaccine shots to avoid getting se-
verely ill.
Commenting as an independent

expert, Associate Professor Alex
Cook, vice-dean of research at the
National University of Singapore’s
Saw Swee Hock School of Public
Health, said the study is important
as it sheds new light on the under-
studied issue of long Covid in Sin-
gapore.
“Although the Covid-19 pandem-

ic may be past, Covid-19 as an ill-

ness remains with us, and the
NTU-led study re-emphasises the
need to stay up to date with your
Covid-19 boosters,” he added.
However, the research team be-

hind the study noted that there are
limitations to it.
The uninfected group tracked in

the analysis includes those who
were asymptomatic or did not seek
medical care, which may have led
to misclassification.
In addition, individual health

measurements such as blood pres-
sure and body mass index, which
are associated with the risk of
heart complications, were not con-
sidered.
The team will be looking at irrit-

ability, memory problems and
mood swings, aswell as respiratory
complications and the effect of
long Covid on healthcare utilisa-
tion, in its future research.
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